


Contract Review
1 of 1 4/16/2020

Contract: RR-16-4267 Supplement I PSB:

Consultant: Environmental Design International, Inc.

PM: Laura Thompson

Reviewer: Sherita Kelly Review Date: 3/30/20

Resolution: Completed

Agreement Completed

Proposal Completed

Certifications/Disclosures Completed

Delinquent Debt Completed

DBE Compliance: Completed

W-9 Form NA

Certificate of Good Standing: Completed

Certificate of Insurance: Completed  
_________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Exhibits E, B and G

Environmental Design International, Inc. (Revised and completed)
Please provide the Insurance documents for this supplement.
Exhibit E: Key Personnel- ONLY key employees are listed on this exhibit per the PSB item description
for required key personnel. The names that were submitted on the SOI to fulfill the PSB required key
personnel are the ONLY names that need to be listed and SHOULD match. This means that not every
Consultant will have Key Personnel. In the event there is a change to Key Personnel from what was
submitted per the SOI, please include a letter of justification for the change, addressed to Mr. Paul
Kovacs, Chief Engineering Officer. This letter needs to be submitted to the PM for review and approval,
copy myself.  The letter should be submitted as soon as possible

Singh & Associates, Inc. (Revised and Complete)
Exhibit B: Calculations are off by .01 cent, please correct to exact dollars.
Exhibit G: Should be marked NA



































From: Thompson, Laura
To: Kelly, Sherita; Kyle Chamberlain
Cc: Stukel, Gregory; Williams, Donna
Subject: RE: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
Date: Thursday, April 16, 2020 1:21:40 PM

Sharita-
 
Please see attached memo. This approval was routed through the Chief engineer prior to the
supplement documents being submitted. Please let me know if you need anything else.
 
Thanks,
 

Laura Thompson, P.E.
(331) 481-3070
(630) 241-6800 x6210
 

From: Kelly, Sherita 
Sent: Thursday, April 16, 2020 1:10 PM
To: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com>
Cc: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com>; Stukel, Gregory <gstukel@getipass.com>;
Williams, Donna <DMWilliams@getipass.com>
Subject: RE: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
 
Hi Kyle-
 
Hope that you have been well. I am in the process of a final review of the
documents submitted for the supplement before requesting approval and
signatures. I noticed you are not included as Key Personnel on the original
contract in 2017.
 
While I’m fairly new at this process and still learning procedures, I believe there
should be a memo/letter submitted to our Chief Engineering Officer, Mr. Paul
Kovacs regarding any Key Staff personnel changes.
 
I don’t believe this will prevent me from moving forward, but I would like to have
this information as soon as possible.
 
Thanks,
 
Sherita Kelly
Contract Analyst
Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
P 630-241-6800 Ext. 4645
skelly@getipass.com
 
From: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 12:26 PM



To: Kelly, Sherita <skelly@getipass.com>
Cc: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com>; Flores, Ed <Eduardo.Flores@getipass.com>;
Stukel, Gregory <gstukel@getipass.com>; Williams, Donna <DMWilliams@getipass.com>
Subject: RE: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
 
Sherita –
 
Great timing! I just saw your email come through as I was preparing this response. 
 
Please see the attachments for the revised Singh exhibits as well as the Insurance paperwork for
EDI.  Should you have any questions or concerns with any of this, do not hesitate to contact me.
 
Also, please note that the Tollway has all of the resumes for the key personnel involved and new
personnel has not been added for this supplement.
 
Thank you and stay safe,
 
Kyle Chamberlain, PE
Civil Project Manager kchamberlain@envdesigni.com
Office: 312.345.1400
Cell: 773.203.3553
 

From: Kelly, Sherita <skelly@getipass.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 12:00 PM
To: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com>
Cc: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com>; Flores, Ed <Eduardo.Flores@getipass.com>;
Stukel, Gregory <gstukel@getipass.com>; Williams, Donna <DMWilliams@getipass.com>
Subject: RE: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
 
This email is from an external source.

Hi Kyle-
 
What is the status of the pending items?
 
Thanks,
 
Sherita Kelly
Contract Analyst
Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
P 630-241-6800 Ext. 4645
skelly@getipass.com
 
From: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2020 3:08 PM
To: Kelly, Sherita <skelly@getipass.com>
Cc: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com>; Flores, Ed <Eduardo.Flores@getipass.com>;



Stukel, Gregory <gstukel@getipass.com>; Williams, Donna <DMWilliams@getipass.com>
Subject: RE: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
 
Sherita –
 
Just wanted to give you a quick update about this.  I am still waiting on the Insurance paperwork but
have finalized everything else. 
 
Once I receive the final documents, I will FWD all to you to continue your review.
 
Kyle Chamberlain, PE
Civil Project Manager kchamberlain@envdesigni.com
Office: 312.345.1400
Cell: 773.203.3553
 

From: Kelly, Sherita <skelly@getipass.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2020 8:39 AM
To: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com>
Cc: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com>; Flores, Ed <Eduardo.Flores@getipass.com>;
Stukel, Gregory <gstukel@getipass.com>; Williams, Donna <DMWilliams@getipass.com>
Subject: RR-16-4267_Environmental Design_Supplement I
 
This email is from an external source.

Good morning-
 
I have completed the initial review of your proposal. Please see the attached summary and update
your proposal according to the items listed and send it back to us as soon as possible. If you have
questions, please let me know.
 
Thanks,
 
Sherita Kelly
Contract Analyst
Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
P 630-241-6800 Ext. 4645
skelly@getipass.com
 

E-MAIL CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic mail message, including any attachments, is for the intended recipient(s)
only. This e-mail and any attachments might contain information that is confidential, legally privileged or otherwise protected or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not a named recipient, or if you are named but believe that you received
this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately by telephone or return e-mail and promptly delete this e-mail and any
attachments and copies thereof from your system. If you are not the intended recipient, please be aware that any copying,
distribution, dissemination, disclosure or other use of this e-mail and any attachments is unauthorized and prohibited. Your
receipt of this message is not intended to waive any applicable privilege or claim of confidentiality, and any prohibited or
unauthorized disclosure is not binding on the Illinois State Toll Highway Authority. Thank you for your cooperation.

























From: Kyle Chamberlain
To: Thompson, Laura; Jillyn O"Shea; Kelly, Sherita
Cc: Flores, Ed; Leslie Sawyer
Subject: RE: 4267 Supplement Agreement Requiring signature
Date: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 9:08:40 AM

Laura and Sherita –
 
Please see the attached document for the Supplement Agreement as signed by our President, Leslie
Sawyer.  I authorize the attached document for processing.
 
I have the additional hard copies with wet signatures and will be mailing them later on tonight or
tomorrow, so hopefully they will be coming in early next week.  Honestly, I have no idea if this
unprecedented pandemic has affected the USPS, so I will keep my fingers crossed.
 
If, by chance, you do not receive this material by end of next week, please follow up and we can
coordinate on this further.
 
Thanks and stay safe,
 
Kyle Chamberlain, PE
Civil Project Manager kchamberlain@envdesigni.com
Office: 312.345.1400
Cell: 773.203.3553
 

From: Thompson, Laura <lthompson@getipass.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2020 10:19 AM
To: Kyle Chamberlain <kchamberlain@envdesigni.com>; Jillyn O'Shea <joshea@envdesigni.com>
Cc: Flores, Ed <Eduardo.Flores@getipass.com>
Subject: 4267 Supplement Agreement Requiring signature
 
This email is from an external source.

Kyle-
 
Please see the attached agreement document for the supplement. This document will need to be
signed and emailed to Sherita skelly@getipass.com and myself with Leslie’s signature. Once that is
complete, please mail 2 original signatures to the below attention.
 
Illinois Tollway
Attn: Sherita Kelly
Contract Analyst - Procurement
2700 Ogden Ave
Downers Grove, IL 60515
 
Let me know if there are any questions.
 
Thanks,



 

Laura Thompson, P.E.
Senior Project Engineer

Illinois Tollway
Lthompson@getipass.com
(331) 481-3070
(630) 241-6800 x6210

2700 Ogden Ave
Downers Grove, IL 60515
 

E-MAIL CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic mail message, including any attachments, is for the intended recipient(s)
only. This e-mail and any attachments might contain information that is confidential, legally privileged or otherwise protected or
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not a named recipient, or if you are named but believe that you received
this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately by telephone or return e-mail and promptly delete this e-mail and any
attachments and copies thereof from your system. If you are not the intended recipient, please be aware that any copying,
distribution, dissemination, disclosure or other use of this e-mail and any attachments is unauthorized and prohibited. Your
receipt of this message is not intended to waive any applicable privilege or claim of confidentiality, and any prohibited or
unauthorized disclosure is not binding on the Illinois State Toll Highway Authority. Thank you for your cooperation.













Exhibit F







Exhibit F













Complete the following information and it will be populated on every exhibit. 

Environmental Design International inc.

RR-16-4267

3/11/2020





















Complete the following information and it will be populated on every exhibit. 

A. Epstein and Sons International, Inc.

RR-16-4267

3/11/2020





















Complete the following information and it will be populated on every exhibit. 

Singh & Associates, Inc.

RR-16-4267

3/11/2020




















