BIDOPENINGRESULTS

IFB

Contract#/Description:21-0069 Job Order Contracting (JOC) for Fadlities

Due Date: Friday, September 9, 2022
Time: 10:30a.m. CT

General Contractor
Zones

Zone C

Zone E

Zone F

$
. $22,452,960.00 $22,452,960.00 $22,452,960.00 $22,452,960.00 22,452,960.00 22,452,960.00 22,452,960.
Leopardo Companies 00
FH Paschen, S.N. s
Nielsen & Associates $24,215,000.00 $24,215,000.00 $24,215,000.00 $24,215,000.00 24,215,000.00 24,215,000.00 24,215,000.
00
LLC
$
SeleCt Development Inc $36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 36,000,000.00 36,000,000.00 | 36,000,000.
00
. $
AnChOF Mechanlcal $ 25,085,000.00 $25,085,000.00 $25,085,000.00 $25,085,000.00 25,085,000.00 25,085,000.00 | 25,085,000.
00
oy . S
MCDonagh DemO'Itlon $ 23,838,000.00 $21,619,500.00 $23,838,000.00 $23,838,000.00 23,838,000.00 24,408,000.00 | 21,619,500.
00
S
$22,312,600.00 $22,338,700.00 $22,338,700.00 $22,312,600.00 22,338,700.00 23,748,100.00 | 22,312,600.
AGAE Contractors, Inc 00
Old Veteran S
. $21,892,100.00 NO BID $22,040,000.00 $23,023,100.00 NO BID NO BID 22,040,000.
Construction Inc 00
$
Drive Construction, Inc $26,042,000.00 $26,042,000.00 $26,042,000.00 $26,042,000.00 26,042,000.00 26,564,000.00 | 26,042,000.
00
Pacific Construction 5
X $22,292,300.00 $22,895,500.00 $22,895,500.00 $22,895,500.00 22,292,300.00 22,292,300.00 | 22,895,500.
Services 00
Griggs Mitchell & Assoc
$35,380,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 35,380,000.
of IL 00
S
Robe Inc $23,130,400.00 $23,130,400.00 $23,130,400.00 $23,130,400.00 23,130,400.00 24,490,500.00 | 25,839,000.
00
Taza Construction dba 5
. $37,500,000.00 $37,500,000.00 $37,500,000.00 $37,500,000.00 37,500,000.00 37,500,000.00 | 37,500,000.
Tiles In Style LLC 00
Ujamaa Construction $
$25,821,600.00 $25,821,600.00 $25,821,600.00 $25,821,600.00 25,821,600.00 25,821,600.00 | 25,821,600.
Inc 00
Select Development Inc $
. $ 36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 $36,000,000.00 36,000,000.00 36,000,000.00 | 36,000,000.
- Alt Bid 00
Angstrom LLC $26,385,65000 | $27,368,75000 | $27,368,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Electrical, Plumbing and HVAC Zones

Plumbing Plumbing Electrical Electrical HVAC HVAC
$2,832,088. | $2,832,088. | $2,832,088. | $2,832,088. | $5,760,180.0 | $5,760,180.0
Leopardo Companies 50 50 50 50 0 0
NO BID NO BID $3,575,400. | $3,575,400. NO BID NO BID
Stingray Electric LLC 00 00
Select Development Inc | $6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | $10,500,000. | $10,500,000.
00 00 00 00 00 00
Anchor Mechanical $2,463,250. | $2,463,250. | $2,516,350. | $2,516,350. | $4,632,000.0 | $4,632,000.0
00 00 00 00 0 0
Engineered Services Inc | $4,715,885. | $4,715,885. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
00 00
Drive Construction, Inc | $3,693,400. | $3,693,400. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
00 00
Autumn Constructions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 5
Services, Inc. 5,553,375.00 | 5,553,375.00
$3,392,000. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ryan's Plumbing 1 Inc 00
S S
_SeAIEC;.geVGIOpment InC | ¢6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | $6,000,000. | 10,500,000.0 | 10,500,000.0
! 00 00 00 00 0 0
NO BID NO BID $2,637,595. | $2,637,595. NO BID NO BID
Pace Systems Inc 00 00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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22-0042 Out of State Data Retrieval Service
22-557THA-BUSSY-B-29220
09/13/2022
10:30 a.m. CST

1. Duncan Solutions, LLC
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