
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description: 23-0143 Refurbishing Services for Aluminum Sign Blanks and 
Aluminum Extrusions 

Due Date: 10/25/2023 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Hi-tech Welding Service Inc  $11,095,000.00 

Northwest Sign Recycling  $1,085,000.00 

Midwest Mobile Waterjet,LLC DBA AWT LLC  $645,950.00 
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Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y 
2700 Ogden Avenue │Downers Grove, IL  60515 │ Phone: 630.241.6800 │TTY: 630.241.6988 

www.illinoistollway.com 

BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description: 23-0095 Job Order Contracting for General Construction and 
Mechanical Services SBI ROCIP 

Due Date: 10/18/2023 

Time: 10:00 a.m.  

 

SMB Contracting Inc 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2,035,800.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $678,600.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $678,600.00 

  

Zone 2 $2,035,800.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $678,600.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $678,600.00 

  

Zone 3 $2,035,800.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $678,600.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $678,600.00 

  

Zone 4 $4,245,600.00 
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Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,415,200.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,415,200.00 

  
 

Adelante Construction Group LLC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2,187,958.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $729,319.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $729,319.50 

  

Zone 2 $2,345,908.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $781,969.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $781,969.50 

  

Zone 3 $2,187,958.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $729,319.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $729,319.50 

  

Zone 4 $4,562,922.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,520,974.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,520,974.00 

  
 

TILES IN STYLE 
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2.60 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $2.60 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $2.60 

  

Zone 2 $2.60 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $2.60 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $2.60 

  

Zone 3 $2.60 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $2.60 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $2.60 

  

Zone 4 $2.60 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $2.60 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $2.60 

  
 

GWO Trucking, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2,242,275.75 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $747,425.25 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $747,425.25 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y 
2700 Ogden Avenue │Downers Grove, IL  60515 │ Phone: 630.241.6800 │TTY: 630.241.6988 

www.illinoistollway.com 

  

Zone 2 $2,242,275.75 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $747,425.25 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $747,425.25 

  

Zone 3 $2,242,275.75 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $747,425.25 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $747,425.25 

  

Zone 4 $4,676,199.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,558,773.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,558,773.00 

  
 

dardon construction inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2,247,102.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $786,474.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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Zone 3 $2,247,102.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $786,474.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $808,938.00 

  

Zone 4 $4,686,264.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,640,168.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,687,016.00 

  
 

Select Development Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $1,004,865.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $731,252.28 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $731,252.28 

  

Zone 2 $1,004,865.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $731,252.28 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $731,252.28 

  

Zone 3 $28,285.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $380,251.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $380,251.00 
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Zone 4 $2,196,001.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $854,001.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $854,001.00 

  
 

Cloone Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $1,524,217.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $508,072.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $508,072.50 

  

Zone 2 $1,524,217.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $508,072.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $508,072.50 

  

Zone 3 $1,524,217.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $508,072.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $508,072.50 

  

Zone 4 $3,178,710.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,059,570.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,059,570.00 
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ACTION PAINTING COMPANY INC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $1,358,370.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $452,790.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $452,790.00 

  

Zone 2 $1,358,370.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $452,790.000 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $452,790.000 

  

Zone 3 $1,358,370.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $452,790.000 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $452,790.000 

  

Zone 4 $2,832,840.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $944,280.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $944,280.00 

  
 

 

AmpolGroup International Inc 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Zone 1 $2,755,255.39 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $918,418.46 
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Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $918,418.46 

  

Zone 2 $2,876,915.71 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $958,971.90 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $958,971.90 

  

Zone 3 $2,755,255.39 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $918,418.46 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $918,418.46 

  

Zone 4 $5,492,283.74 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,830,761.25 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,830,761.25 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description: 23-0059R Roadway Abrasives 

Due Date: 10/17/2023 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

No Bids Received  

  

  

  
 

 

 

 

 

 



 

BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB 

Contract#/Description: 23-0053 Safety Data Sheets Database Management 

Due Date: Friday, October 13, 2023 

Time: 10:00a.m. CT 
 
 

Vendor Name: As Read Amount 
 
Bijjam Information Technologies, Inc 

 
$4,513,200.00 

  

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB 

Contract#/Description: 23-0044R Security Operations Center Program 

Due Date: Thursday, October 12, 2023 

Time: 10:00a.m. CT 
 
 

Vendor Name: As Read Amount 
 
SDI Presence LLC 

 
$4,951,942.50 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description: 23-0073 Job Order Contracting for General Construction and 
Mechanical Service 

Due Date: 10/5/2023 

Time: 10:00 a.m.  

 

1. McDonagh Demolition 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,538,023.35 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,512,674.45 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,512,674.45 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,426,513.35 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,475,504.45 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2  $1,475,504.45 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,538,023.35 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,512,674.45 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,512,674.45 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,281,744.70 
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Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,093,914.90 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,093,914.90 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

2. F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen & Associates LLC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $0.823 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $0.823 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $0.823 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $0.823 
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Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $0.823 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $0.823 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $0.823 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $0.823 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $0.823 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $0.796 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $0.796 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $0.796 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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3. Pacific Construction Services LLC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,762,096.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,587,365.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,587,365.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,762,096.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,587,365.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,587,365.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,762,096.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,587,365.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,587,365.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,985,413.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,328,471.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,328,471.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

4. Stingray Electric LLC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide $1.063 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $1.063 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $1.063 
 

5. AGAE Contractors, Inc 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,584,300.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,528,100.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,528,100.00 
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3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,584,300.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,528,100.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,528,100.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,584,300.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,528,100.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,528,100.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,411,255.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,137,085.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,137,085.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 
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Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

6. Evan's Electric LLC 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide  $1,785,000.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $595,000.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $595,000.00 
 

7. Pace Systems, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
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3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide $1,263,975.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1  $421,325.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2  $421,325.00 
 

 

 

 

8. Drive Construction, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,951,664.00 
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Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,650,555.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,650,555.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,951,664.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,650,555.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,650,555.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,951,664.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,650,555.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,650,555.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $10,382,907.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,460,969.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,460,969.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide $1,380,000.00 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $460,000.00 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $460,000.00 
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3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

9. Griggs Mitchell & Assoc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $7,557,900.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $2,519,300.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $2,519,300.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $15,847,000.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $5,282,600.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $5,282,600.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 
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Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

10. Leopardo Companies 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,665,020.85 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,555,006.95 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,555,006.95 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,720,775.85 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,573,591.95 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,573,591.95 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,609,265.85 
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Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,536,421.95 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,536,421.95 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,664,949.70 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,221,649.90  

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,221,649.90  

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

11. Any Temperature Co., Inc 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 No Bid 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide $1,222,500.00 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

12. Robe, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,759,618.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,586,539.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,586,539.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,982,638.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,660,879.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,660,879.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,759,618.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,586,539.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,586,539.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $10,590,747.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,530,249.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,530,249.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

13. Old Veteran Construction, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,596,690.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,532,230.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,532,230.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,708,200.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,569,400.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,569,400.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $47,639,555.00 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y 
2700 Ogden Avenue │Downers Grove, IL  60515 │ Phone: 630.241.6800 │TTY: 630.241.6988 

www.illinoistollway.com 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,587,985.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,587,985.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $4,596,690.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,532,230.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,532,230.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

14.  Anchor Mechanical, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,605,982.50 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,535,327.50 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,535,327.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,605,982.50  

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,535,327.50 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,535,327.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,605,982.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,535,327.50 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,535,327.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,658,065.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,219,355.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,219,355.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide $1,122,000.00 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $374,000.00 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $374,000.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide $1,216,500.00 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $405,500.00 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $405,500.00 

  



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide $1,263,750.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1  $421,250.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $421,250.00 
 

15. Ujamaa Construction, Inc. 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $5,516,028.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,838,676.00 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,838,676.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $5,516,028.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,838,676.00 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,838,676.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $5,516,028.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,838,676.00 

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,838,676.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $11,566,296.00 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,855,728.50 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,855,728.50 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide No Bid 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 No Bid 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 No Bid 
 

16. Construction Inc 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

3 Year Initial Term Zone 1 $4,714,952.55 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,571,650.85 

Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,571,650.85 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 2 $4,714,952.55 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,571,650.85 

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,571,650.85 

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 3 $4,714,952.55 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,571,650.85  

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,571,650.85  

  

3 Year Initial Term Zone 4 $9,886,559.10 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $3,295,519.70 

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $3,295,519.70 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide $1,222,635.00 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $407,545.00 

Mechanical – HVAC Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $407,545.00 

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Plumbing 
Systemwide $1,182,135.00 

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $394,045.00  

Mechanical – Plumbing Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $394,045.00  

  

3 Year Initial Term Mechanical – Electrical 
Systemwide $1,141,635.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 1 $380,545.00 

Mechanical – Electrical Systemwide Renewal Year 2 $380,545.00 
 

 

 

 


