

IFB

Contract#/Description: 24-0027 Automotive and Heavy Duty Vehicle Painting and Crash Repair

Due Date: 4/3/2024

Time: 10:30 a.m.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Hillside Auto Body & Service, Inc.	\$264,500.00
Ward Auto Body, Inc	\$345,950.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.



IFB

Contract#/Description: 23-0120R_High Resolution Aerial Photography Subscription Services

Due Date: Tuesday, April 9, 2024

Time: 10:30AM

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Nearmap US, Inc.	\$961,389.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.



IFB

Contract#/Description: 24-0030 Electrical Wire and Cable

Due Date: 4/10/2024

Time: 10:30 a.m.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
J. P. Simons & Company	\$338,265.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.



IFB

Contract#/Description: 24-0040 Replacement Doors and Hardware

Due Date: 4/17/2024

Time: 10:30 a.m.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Sure lock & Key Locksmith	\$107,820.00
Accredited Lock and Door Hardware Company	\$0.00
FW Kline, Inc.	\$55,125.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.



IFF

Contract#/Description 23-0133R Pre-Employment Screening

Due Date: 04/22/2024

Time: 10:30 am

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
OOTW, Inc.	\$312,220.00
MS Laboratory, Inc.	\$370,390.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.



IFB

Contract#/Description: 23-0095R Job Order Contracting for General Construction and

Mechanical Services SBI ROCIP

Due Date: 4/23/2024

Time: 10:00 a.m.

TILES IN STYLE

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,263,950.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$754,650.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$754,650.00
Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 4	\$4,721,400.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,573,800.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,573,800.00

Construction Inc

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,335,712.95
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$445,237.65
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$445,237.65
Zone 2	\$1,335,712.95
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$445,237.65
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$445,237.65
Zone 3	\$1,314,547.65
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$438,182.55
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$438,182.55
Zone 4	\$2,576,640.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$858,880.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$858,880.00

SMB Contracting Inc

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,983,150.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$661,050.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$661,050.00
Zone 2	\$1,983,150.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$661,050.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$661,050.00
Zone 3	\$1,983,150.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$661,050.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$661,050.00
Zone 4	\$4,135,800.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,378,600.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,378,600.00

Cloone Inc.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,432,080.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$477,360.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$477,360.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 2	\$1,432,080.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$477,360.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$477,360.00
Zone 3	\$1,432,080.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$477,360.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$477,360.00
Zone 4	\$2,948,130.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$982,710.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$982,710.00

GWO Trucking, Inc.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,930,500.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$643,500.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$643,500.00
Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 3	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 4	\$4,026,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,342,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,342,000.00

ACTION PAINTING COMPANY INC

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,337,310.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$445,770.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$445,770.00
Zone 2	\$1,337,310.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$445,770.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$445,770.00
Zone 3	\$1,337,310.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$445,770.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$445,770.00

Bid results are <u>read as submitted at the bid opening</u>.

Zone 4	\$2,788,920.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$929,640.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$929,640.00

YAD Construction

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,277,990.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$759,330.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$759,330.00
Zone 2	\$2,277,990.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$759,330.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$759,330.00
Zone 3	\$2,277,990.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$759,330.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$759,330.00
Zone 4	\$4,750,680.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,583,560.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,583,560.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Kee Solutions LLC

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,130,727.95
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$710,242.65
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$710,242.65
Zone 2	\$2,016,319.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$672,106.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$672,106.50
Zone 3	\$2,016,319.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$672,106.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$672,106.50
Zone 4	\$4,204,974.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,403,955.80
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,403,955.80

Adelante Construction Group LLC

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,474,550.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$824,850.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

\$824,850.00
\$2,632,500.00
\$877,500.00
\$877,500.00
\$2,474,550.00
\$824,850.00
\$824,850.00
\$5,325,300.00
\$1,775,100.00
\$1,775,100.00

Structure Re-Right, Inc

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,177,955.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$725,985.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$725,985.00
Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 4	\$4,542,060.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,514,020.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,514,020.00

Select Development Inc.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,720,250.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$672,751.42
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$672,751.42
Zone 2	\$2,720,250.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$672,751.42
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$672,751.42
Zone 3	\$2,720,250.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$672,751.42

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$672,751.42
Zone 4	\$4,209,002.83
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,403,002.83
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,403,002.83

Biega Construction Corporation

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,730,780.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$910,260.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$910,260.00
Zone 2	\$3,290,625.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$1,096,875.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$1,096,875.00
Zone 3	\$2,193,750.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$731,250.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$731,250.00
Zone 4	\$5,032,500.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,677,500.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,677,500.00

Czervik Construction

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,018,250.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$672,750.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$672,750.00
Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 4	\$4,209,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,403,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,403,000.00

Reese's H.V.A.C. Heating & Cooling Services, LLC

Vendor Name: Total Bid

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 1	No Bid
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	\$2,530,885.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$843,625.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$843,628.50
Zone 4	No Bid
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	No Bid

dardon construction inc.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1.2804
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$1.3444
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$1.3828

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	\$1.2804
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$1.3444
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$1.3828
Zone 4	\$1.2804
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1.3444
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1.3828

PMJ Enterprises, Inc

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,181,465.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$727,155.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$7,271,550.00
Zone 2	\$2,181,465.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$727,155.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$727,155.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 3	\$2,181,465.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$727,155.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$727,155.00
Zone 4	\$4,549,380.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,516,460.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,516,460.00

Antigua, Inc

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,108,457.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$ 702,819.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$702,819.00
Zone 2	\$2,116,530.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$705,510.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$705,510.00
Zone 3	\$2,131,447.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$705,510.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$705,510.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 4	\$4,481,670.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,493,890.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,493,890.00

Drive Construction, Inc.

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$1,877,850.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$625,950.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$625,950.00
Zone 2	\$1,877,850.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$625,950.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$625,950.00
Zone 3	\$1,877,850.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$625,950.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$625,950.00
Zone 4	\$3,916,200.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,305,400.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,305,400.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

l

TORI Construction, LLC

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,532,465.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$844,155.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$844,155.00
Zone 2	\$2,532,465.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$844,155.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$844,155.00
Zone 3	\$2,532,465.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$844,155.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$844,155.00
Zone 4	\$5,292,924.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,760,460.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,760,460.00

Bell's Better Buildings DBA Twenty Eleven Construction INC

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,344,680.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$781,560.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$781,560.00
Zone 2	\$2,772,900.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	\$924,300.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	\$924,300.00
Zone 3	\$2,344,680.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	\$781,560.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	\$781,560.00
Zone 4	\$4,889,760.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,629,920.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,629,920.00

Griggs Mitchell & Assoc. of IL

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
Zone 1	\$2,141,100.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1	\$713,700.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2	\$713,700.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Zone 2	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 3	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1	No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2	No Bid
Zone 4	\$4,465,200.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1	\$1,488,400.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2	\$1,488,400.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.