The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue

- - Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
léi‘mog 630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax

L]b” Way 630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
wwwe.illinoistollway.com

PROPOSALS OPENING
RFP
14-0107 Rockford Metro Retail Area I-Pass Transponder Placement

Thursday, April 2, 2015, 10:30 A.M.

No Bids



http://www.illinoistollway.com/

,
Illinois
L]b][ way

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515~1703
630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
12-0254R Industrial Supplies

Wednesday, April 15, 2015 Time: 10:30 am

1. Murphy Ace Hardware $63,675.94

2. Cicero Manufacturing & Supplies Co., Inc. $102,332.40

3. J.P. Simons & Co.

$115,742.92

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.


http://www.illinoistollway.com/

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue

- - Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
léi‘mog 630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax

L]b” Way 630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
wwwe.illinoistollway.com

BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
14-0130 Scrap Tire /Rubber Debris Pick-up and Disposal Services

Friday, April 17, 2015 10:30 A.M.

1. D.W.J. Petroleum, Inc. $235,200.00

2. DisposAll Waste Services, LLC $177,600.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



http://www.illinoistollway.com/

’ The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue

ot - Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
117018 630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY
{ 0 WH; 1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

www.illinoistollway.com

PROPOSAL OPENING
RFP
13-0194 Internal Audit Management System Software
Friday, April 24, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 207

No Bids



http://www.illinoistollway.com/
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BID OPENING RESULTS

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

0 _L‘S' RFP Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
v ”Wﬂ_]/ 14-0091. Medium anq Heavy Duty Trucks 228211:2?88 Fax
L Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340 630/241-6898 TTY B
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
www.illinoistollway.com
JX Peterbilt
O De D{10 7 P ded P
1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4 $ 124,840.00  $ 499,360.00
Line 1 Total $ 499,360.00
O ay De pt10 7 P ded P
2 Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3
2A Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1
2B Trade-in 2007 TH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) 1
Line 2 Total No Bid
O ay De D{10 7 P ded P
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7
Line 3 Total No Bid
O ay De pt10 7 P ded P
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel 1 $ 133,295.00 | § 133,295.00
4A Trade-in 2003 ITH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1 $ (15,000.00) $ (15,000.00)
Line 4 Total $ 118,295.00
O ay De Di10 7 P ded P
5 Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1 $ 250,897.00 | $ 250,897.00
5.1 Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pas 1 Included $ ~
5A Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 TH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1 $ (15,000.00) $ (15,000.00)
Line 5 Total
w/0 option $ 235,897.00
Line 5 Total
* w/option $ 235,897.00
O ay De D{10 7 P ded P
6 Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1 $177,724.00 | § 177,724.00
6A Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1 $ (10,000.00)| $ (10,000.00)
Line 6 Total $ 167,724.00

14~-0091 Bid Tab

JX Peterbilt

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.

kk

JX Peterbilt enter the same amount, $235,897.00, for Line #5 w/option and w/o option total bid

They are unable to provide the specified option, 144" maximum outrigger operating width

(outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pad).




’ I ’ ’ RFP
MIIOLS 14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks

LZb]] way

BID OPENING RESULTS

Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Condi
www.illinoistollway.com

ions

TransChicago

1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body $ 122,346.00 | § 489,384.00
Line 1 Total $ 489,384.00
2 | Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515)
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385)
Line 2 Total No Bid
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks $ 104,112.00 | $ 728,784.00
Line 3 Total $ 728,784.00
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel $ 123,718.00 | $ 123,718.00
4A  |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) $ (17,000.00)| $ (17,000.00)
Line 4 Total $ 106,718.00
5 | Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick $ 235,639.00 | § 235,639.00
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pac $ ~ $ ~
S5A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) $ (20,000.00) | $ (20,000.00)
Line 5 Total w/o
option $ 215,639.00
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
6 Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane $ 175,434.00 | $§ 175,434.00
6A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) $ (12,000.00)| $ (12,000.00)
Line 6 Total $ 163,434.00

14~0091 Bid Tab

TransChicago

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




The Illinois State Toll H

ighway Authority

’ BID OPENING RESULTS 2700 Ogden Avenue
" i RFP Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
HIIIIOE 14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 2@8211:2?88 Fax
i ime: 10: 630/241-6898 TTY
]bl[way Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340 B0/241 G8OSTIY
www.illinoistollway.com
WHE Ltd
1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4
Line 1 Total No Bid
2 Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3 § 274,633.33  § 823,899.99
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1 $ (7,500.00) $ (7,500.00)
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) 1 $ (22,000.00)| $ (22,000.00)
* Vendor submitted a total of $794,900.00 for Line 2 * Line 2 Total $ 794,399.99 *
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7
Line 3 Total No Bid
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel 1
4A  |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1
Line 4 Total No Bid
5 |Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger p: 1
5A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1
Line 5 Total
w/o option
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
6 Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane
6A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499)
Line 6 Total No Bid
14~0091 Bid Tab
WHE Lid
Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




,

Lfbl[ way

BID OPENING RESULTS
RFP
14~-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

Llinois

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road, Conditions
www.illinoistollway.com

R.N.O.W.
O De pt10 Qua P ded P
1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4
Line 1 Total No Bid
O ay De pt10 Qua P ended P
2 Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3 $ 213,288.00 | $ 639,864.00
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1 $  (5,000.00)| $ (5,000.00)
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) $ (15,000.00)| $ (15,000.00)
Line 2 Tota $ 619,864.00
O ay De pi10 Qua P s ended P
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7
Line 3 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel 1
4A | Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1
Line 4 Total
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
5  |Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pa 1
5A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1
Line 5 Total
w/0 option No Bid
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
6 |Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1
6A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1

Line 6 Total

No Bid

14~-0091 Bid Tab

R.N.O.W.

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.
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L]bﬂ way

BID OPENING RESULTS
RFP
14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

Llinois

The Illinois State Toll
2700 Ogden Avenue

Highway Authority

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Rog
www.illinoistollway.

d Conditions
com

R.N.O.W. Alternate Bid 1

Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4
Line 1 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
2 | Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3 $ 216,791.00 | $§ 650,373.00
2A | Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1 $ (10,000.00)  $ (10,000.00)
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) 1 $ (25,000.00) $ (25,000.00)
Line 2 Tota $ 615,373.00
O ay De pt10 Qud Price ended P
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7
Line 3 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5 Wheel 1
4A  |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1
Line 4 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
5 Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1
5.1 | Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pa 1
5A  Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 TH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1
Line 5 Total
w/o option No Bid
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
6 |Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1
6A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1

Line 6 Total

No Bid

14~-0091 Bid Tab

R.N.O.W. Alternate Bid 1

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




,

; Zbﬂway Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

BID OPENING RESULTS
RFP

ﬂ]IIIOLS' 14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

www.illinoistollway.com

Rush Truck Centers

O De ptio Qua g ended
1 Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4 $ 118,332.00 | $ 473,328.00
Line 1 Total $ 473,328.00
O ay De onle Qua Price ended P
2 Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385)
Line 2 Tota No Bid
O ay De pi10 Qua P S ended P
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7 $ 102,221.00 | $ 715,547.00
Line 3 Total $ 715,547.00
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
4 Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel 1 $ 136,328.00 | $ 136,328.00
4A  |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1 $ (15,000.00) $ (15,000.00)
Line 4 Total $ 121,328.00
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
5 Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1 $ 238,584.00 § 238,584.00
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pe 1 $ - $ ~
5A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1 $ (15,000.00) $ (15,000.00)
Line 5 Total w/o
option $  223,584.00
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
6 Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1
6A  |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1

Line 6 Total

No Bid

14~-0091 Bid Tab

Rush Truck Centers

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.
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BID OPENING RESULTS
RFP
14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

linois

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Cond
www.illinoistollway.com

itions

Rush Truck Centers Alternate Bid 1

Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
1  |Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4
Line 1 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
2 | Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) 1
Line 2 Total No Bid
O De gnle Qua P 5 ended P
3 Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7 $ 103,869.00  § 727,083.00
Line 3 Total $ 727,083.00
O De onle O, P 5 ended P
4 | Semi-~Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel
4A |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812)
Line 4 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
5 | Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1 $ 267,854.00  $§ 267,854.00
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pa 1 $ ~ $ ~
5A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1 $ (15,000.00)| $ (15,000.00)
Line 5 Total w/o
option $ 252,854.00
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
6 |Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1
6A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1

Line 6 Total

No Bid

14~-0091 Bid Tab

Rush Truck Centers Alternate Bid 1

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




’

: E[[Way Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

BID OPENING RESULTS
RFP

.”]IIIOE 14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Cq
www.illinoistollway.com

nditions

Rush Truck Centers Alternate Bid 2
Tollway Description

Unit Price

Extended Price

1 |Cab and Chassis with Van Body 4
Line 1 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
2 |Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper 3
2A  |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515) 1
2B |Trade-in 2007 TH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385) 1
Line 2 Total No Bid
H O ay De pt10 Qua P ded P
3 |Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks 7 $ 104,647.00 | § 732,529.00
Line 3 Total $ 732,529.00
z O ay De pt10 Q, P ended Price
4  |Semi-~Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel 1
4A |Trade-in 2003 IH Model 9900 (Asset #59812) 1
Line 4 Total No Bid
Line # Tollway Description Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
5 | Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick 1
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pa 1
5A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820) 1
Line 5 Total w/o
option No Bid
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
H O ay De pt10 Qua P ded P
6 |Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane 1
6A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499) 1
Line 6 Total No Bid

14-0091 Bid Tab

Rush Truck Centers Alternate Bid 2

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




Y BID OPENING RESULTS
, ﬂ] . . RFP
11015 14-0091 Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks

Tuesday, April 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 am Room 340

L?bl[ way

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703

630/241-6800
630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road C
www.illinoistollway.com

pnditions

Standard Equipment
O De pt10 P ded P
1 | Cab and Chassis with Van Body
Line 1 Total No Bid
O ay De pt10 P ended P
2  |Conventional Cab and Chassis with Mechanical Street Sweeper
2A |Trade-in 2003 IH 4300 with Johnston 7700 Sweeper (Asset #59515)
2B |Trade-in 2007 IH 4300 with Alliance 350 Sweeper (Asset #66385)
Line 2 Total No Bid
O ay De pti10 Price ended P
3  |Crew Cab and Chassis, Low Profile Platform Stake Body with Rear Channel Basket and Sign Racks
Line 3 Total No Bid
O ay De pt10 Price ended P
4  Semi-Tractor, Tandem Axle with 5™ Wheel
4A |Trade-in 2003 TH Model 9900 (Asset #59812)
Line 4 Total No Bid
O ay De pt10 P s ended P
5 | Cab and Chassis with Line Body and Digger Derrick
5.1 |Option Pricing 144 Inch Outrigger Operating Width (outside edge to outside edge of each outrigger pac
5A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2003 IH 4400 Chassis with Aerial Lift (Asset #59820)
Line 5 Total w/o
option No Bid
Line 5 Total
w/option No Bid
O ay De pt10 P ended P
6 |Cab and Chassis with Remounted of National 657C Crane
6A |Trade-in Cab and Chassis, 2000 IH 2654 Chassis Only (Asset #55499)
Line 6 Total No Bid

14-0091 Bid Tab

Standard Equipment

Award shall be by line item / bidders not required to bid all line items.




The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703

l f] . - 630/241-6800
110IS 630/241-6100 Fax
630/241-6898 TTY

Zb ”Wa y 1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

www.illinoistollway.com

BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
13~0251 Trinity Guardrail Parts

Wednesday, April 22, 2015 Time: 10:30 am

Vendor Name

No Bids

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



http://www.illinoistollway.com/
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