The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue

& P Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
630/241-6800

Hlinois (TR
630/241-6898 TTY

y Zb ”Wa y 1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

www.illinoistollway.com

BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
13~0216R Lumber and Plywood
Monday, July 6, 2015 Time: 10:30 A.M. Room 225N

Vendor Name:

Construction Materials and Supply Resources LLC $126,594.90

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Bid Opening Results
IFB
12-0063R Preventative Maintenance and Repair of Boilers and Hot Water Heat

Monday, July 13, 2015 Time: 10:30 A.M.

Vendor Name:

NO BIDS

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Bid Opening Resulis
IFB

13~-0251R Trinity Guardrail Parts
Tuesday, July 14, 2015 Time: 10:30 A.M.

Vendor Name: Grand Total

Industrial Fence, Inc. $210,199.55

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
12~0289R Building Glass Repair Services
Wednesday, July 22, 2015

Vendor Name:

No Bid

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue

& P Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
630/241-6800
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

15~-0037 Original Equipment Manufacturer (O.E.M.) Printer Cartridges
Friday, July 24, 2015 Time: 10:30 A.M. Room 215

1. Vendor Name: Atlas Stationers, Inc. Total
Group 1 $52,500.00
Group 2 $56,250.00
Group 3 $1,800.00
Group 4 $10,500.00
Group 5 $3,410.00
Group 6 $2,900.00

2. gigggf Iljlac.fne: Laser Technology Total
Group 1 $2,250.00
Group 2 $2,250.00
Group 3 $360.00
Group 4 $207.00
Group 5 $162.00

3. ggﬁ?&l I;I.ame: InteGreat Technology Total
Group 1 $71,250.00
Group 2 $71,250.00
Group 3 $1,960.00
Group 4 $14,250.00
Group 5 $1,960.00
Group 6 $0.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



http://www.illinoistollway.com/

4. Vendor Name: The Office Pal. Total

Group 1 $45,000.00
Group 2 $56,250.00
Group 3 No Bid
Group 4 No Bid
Group 5 No Bid
5. Vendor Name: Velocita Technology. Total

Group 1 $71,250.00
Group 2 $69,750.00
Group 3 $1,800.00
Group 4 $13,950.00
Group 5 $6,294.00
Group 6 $4,918.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
15~-0078 Hewlett Packard Software, Licenses, Maintenance, and Support
Tuesday, July 28, 2015 Time: 10:30 A.M. Room, 215

Vendor Name: Total For Initial Term Total For Renewal Term

Aptude, Inc. $296,087.58 $310,471.64

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
14~0157 Overhead Garage Door Parts and Repair Services

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

Vendor Name: Grand Total

Builders Chicago Corporation $96,594.90

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
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110IS 630/241-6100 Fax
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

1. Vendor: Suburban Towing

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 $4,450.00 $10,145.00
M-2 N/A N/A
M-3 N/A N/A
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 N/A N/A
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 N/A N/A

Page 1 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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, The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

2. Vendor: E&R Towing & Garage, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 $5,925.00 $17,450.00
M-2 N/A N/A
M-3 N/A N/A
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 N/A N/A
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 N/A N/A

Page 2 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

3. Vendor: Maggio Truck Center

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 N/A N/A
M-2 N/A N/A
M-3 N/A N/A
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 $9,550.00 $23,687.50
M-7 $9,050.00 $19,812.50
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 $9,050.00 $20,187.50
M-12 $9,550.00 $23,687.50
M-14 N/A N/A

Page 3 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

4. Vendor: Hillside Auto Body & Service, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”

M-1 N/A N/A

M-2 N/A N/A

M-3 $4,525.00 $9,170.00

M-4 $4,525.00 $9,845.00

M-5 $4,450.00 $9,170.00

M-6 $5,125.00 $10,875.00

M-7 N/A N/A

M-8 $5,225.00 $11,475.00

M-11 N/A N/A

M-12 N/A N/A

M-14 $5,125.00 $17,675.00

Page 4 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

, 2700 Ogden Avenue
& P Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
630/241-6800
MHOE 630/241-6100 Fax
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

5. Vendor: Naperville Towing Service, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”

M-1 N/A N/A

M-2 N/A N/A

M-3 N/A N/A

M-4 N/A N/A

M-5 N/A N/A

M-6 N/A N/A

M-7 N/A N/A

M-8 $2,125.00 $5,450.00

M-11 N/A N/A

M-12 N/A N/A

M-14 $2,225.00 $14,840.00

Page 5 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
, 2700 Ogden Avenue
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

6. Vendor: O’Hare Towing Services

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 N/A N/A
M-2 $5,244.35 $15,976.01
M-3 $5,244.35 $15,976.01
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 $6,030.05 $18,370.97
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 $5,244.35 $15,976.01
M-11 $6,017.35 $17,573.59
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 $5,244.35 $15,976.01

Page 6 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority

, 2700 Ogden Avenue
& P Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

7. Vendor: West & Sons Towing, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 N/A N/A
M-2 N/A N/A
M-3 N/A N/A
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 N/A N/A
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 $5,275.00 $17,950.00

Page 7 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

8. Vendor: Ernie’s Wrecker Service, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 N/A N/A
M-2 N/A N/A
M-3 $3,375.00 $12,625.00
M-4 $3,375.00 $12,625.00
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 N/A N/A
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 N/A N/A

Page 8 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment

Thursday, July 30, 2015 Room 340N

9. Vendor: District Recovery, Inc.

Total Bid Total Bid
M-Site/Coverage Area
Rate Schedule “A” Rate Schedule “B”
M-1 $5,225.00 $13,330.00
M-2 $5,675.00 $12,820.00
M-3 N/A N/A
M-4 N/A N/A
M-5 N/A N/A
M-6 N/A N/A
M-7 N/A N/A
M-8 N/A N/A
M-11 N/A N/A
M-12 N/A N/A
M-14 $5,735.00 $19,670.00

Page 9 of 9
15~0004R Towing and Road Services for Tollway Vehicles and Equipment
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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