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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
www.illinoistollway.com

BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB

14~-0080 Dual Pouch Plastic Money Bags
Wednesday, August 6, 2014, Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 215

VENDOR NAME: ToTAL BID
1. Alert It Solutions Inc. $338,980.00
2. Diebold Inc. $60,000.00
3. Dunbar Security Products $264,240.00
4. Innovative Assembly Design $511,200.00
5. NELMAR Security Packing Systems Inc. | $226,800.00
Alfernate Bid:
NELMAR Security Packing Systems Inc. | $234,000.00
6. Secure Products Corp No Pricing Provided

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

13-0056 Roadway Sweepings Removal and Disposal

Tuesday, Aug

Name: Independent Recycling Services, Inc.

st 12, 2014 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 215

Estimated Quantity (Tons)

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
www.illinoistollway.com

Line # Maintenance Site Pick~up Location nitial thres (3) year term Total Bid
1-294 at Cicero Avenue
1 M-1 Alsip Milepost 12.5 Northbound 1410 $105,750.00
1-294 North of Cermak Road
2 M-2 Hillside Milepost 30 Northbound 1410 $105,750.00
[-294 North of Touhy Avenue
3 M-3 Park Ridge Milepost 41.7 Northbound 1410 $105,750.00
IL Route 132 (Grand Avenue) and Tri-State
4 M-4 Gurnee Tollway Milepost 8.4 1410 $105,750.00
[-90 at Route 53
5 M-5 Schaumburg Milepost 68.3 Eastbound 1410 $105,750.00
1-90 and Route 20
6 M-6 Marengo Milepost 41.9 Westbound 720 $50,400.00
[-90 at Route 20
7 M-7 Rockford Milepost 15.8 Westbound 1410 $98,700.00
1-88 at Naperville Road
8 M-8 Naperville Milepost 127.6 Westbound 1410 $105,750.00
1-355 at [-88
9 M-14 Downers Grove Milepost 21.9 Northbound 1410 $105,750.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
630/241-6800
HOLS' 630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions

E”W‘g www.illinoistollway.com
/. B

BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

12-0164R ASCO Switches and Parts
Friday, August 15, 2014 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 320

AC Gentrol $70,245.00

Intex Lighting $122,077.70

Custom Electrical Systems, Inc. $146,370.00

Ficek Electric & Communication | $150,111.56

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



http://www.illinoistollway.com/

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

13-0052 Asphalt Repair Equipment
Friday, August 15, 2014 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 320

1. Vendor Name: Cummings, McGowan & West Incorporated

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment II,

Line-2 | Specification FS~-467 $ No Bid
Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment ],

Line-3 Specification FS-401 $495,675.00

2. Vendor Name: Finkbiner Equipment Co.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $ No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment II,

Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $ 235,165.00
Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment ],
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $ No Bid
Page 1 of 4

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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3. Vendor Name: KM International Inc.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $153,920.00

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $No Bid

4. Vendor Name: McCann Industries, Inc.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $ No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $212,310

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $ No Bid

5. Vendor Name: Sherwin Industries Inc.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment II,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment ],
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $503,892.00
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Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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6. Vendor Name: Thorworks Industries Inc.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $447,840.00

7. Vendor Name: Stepp Manufacturing Company, Inc.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 Specification FS-404-1 $133,668.00

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $689,544.00

8. Vendor Name: Steven J. Konstanty dba Galva Road Equipment, LLC Bid 1

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $67,230.00

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment II,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $ No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment ],
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $ No Bid
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Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



Vendor Name: Steven J. Konstanty dba Galva Road Equipment, LLC Bid 2

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $97,350.00

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS-467 $No Bid

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $ No Bid

9. Vendor Name: WHT Ltd.

Line Description Total Bid

Portable Asphalt Recycling Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment HH,
Line-1 | Specification FS-404-1 $No Bid

Dual Drum Vibratory Articulated Asphalt Roller
Attachment I,
Line-2 | Specification FS~-467 $250,600.00

Towable Diesel Powered Crack Sealing Machine, Trailer Mounted
Attachment JJ,
Line-3 | Specification FS-401 $No Bid
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Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

12-0140R Bulk Steel and Metals
Wednesday, August 27, 2014 10:30 am Room 225

AC GENTROL, INC. $27,826.99

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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