



**BID OPENING RESULTS**

**IFB**

**17-0088 Refurbishing Services for Aluminum Sign Blanks and Aluminum Extrns**

**Friday, June 16, 2017, 10:30 A.M.**

Vendor Name:	Total Bid
NO BIDS	

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY

2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988

[www.illinoistollway.com](http://www.illinoistollway.com)



## BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB

17-0084 Out-of-State Registration Retrieval Services  
Due Date: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 Time: 10:30 Room 175

Vendor Name	Total Bid Three (3) Year Term:
1. RGA Solutions LLC	\$915,000.00
2. Chicago Advisors LLC	\$1,500,000.00
3. Duncan Solutions Inc.	\$1,335,000.00
4. Accurate Data, Inc.	\$1,815,000.00
5. Morningsong Management Company	\$2,085,000.00
6. M&M Staffing Agency	\$3,195,000.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.



## BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB

16-0109 Intelligent Transportation System (ITS) Replacement Parts

Due Date: Wednesday, June 21, 2017 Time: 10:30 Room 219B

1. Vendor Name: Tri-Star Supply	
Total Pricing Group A	No Bid
Total Pricing Group B	No Bid
Total Pricing Group C	No Bid
Total Pricing Group D	No Bid
Total Pricing Group E	\$557,780.00

2. Vendor Name: Meade	
Total Pricing Group A	\$460,871.50
Total Pricing Group B	\$222,467.70
Total Pricing Group C	\$849,120.00
Total Pricing Group D	\$253,599.00
Total Pricing Group E	\$686,106.25

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.